
ABSTRACT 

The fate of 75Se-labelled S. mansoni (Puerto Rican strain) schistosomula in albino male mice (CD-1 
strain) treated with Roll-0761 compared to untreated controls was followed by compressed tissue 
autoradiography. Roll-0761 had profound effects on the distribution of schistosomula in that no parasites 
migrated beyond the skin when treatment was initiated on day 0 prior to infection or on day one through 6 
pi. The number of schistosomula detected as autoradiographic foci were significantly lower in treated 
mice than controls. Test mice were free of any autoradiographic foci 7 days after treatment and no adult 
worms were recovered on day 42 pi. The site of schistosomula elimination was found to be in the tissue 
or organ where parasites were arrested due to the effects of the drug. These results were in contrast with 
the untreated mice where appreciable attrition occurred in the pulmonary and hepatic phase of 
schistosomular development. Compressed tissue autoradiography is considered to be an accurate and 
sensitive technique in determining the efficacy of schistosomulicides in experimental 
schistosomiasis.ADDITIONAL ABSTRACT:The fate of 75Se-labelled Schistosoma mansoni schistosomula 
in mice treated with Roll-0761 compared to untreated controls was followed by compressed tissue 
autoradiography. Roll-0761 had profound effects on the distribution of schistosomula in that no parasites 
migrated beyond the skin when treatment was initiated on day zero prior to infection or on day 1 through 
6 after infection. The numbers of schistosomula detected as autoradiographic foci were significantly lower 
in treated mice than controls. Test mice were free of any autoradiographic foci 7 days after treatment and 
no adult worms were recovered on day 42 after infection. The site of schistosomula elimination was found 
to be in the tissue or organ where parasites were arrested due to the effects of the drug. These results 
were in contrast with the untreated mice where appreciable attrition occurred in the pulmonary and 
hepatic phase of schistosomular development. Compressed tissue autoradiography was found to be an 
accurate and sensitive technique in determining the efficacy of schistosomulicides in experimental 
schistosomiasis. 
 


